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Evolving Nationalism examines how the idea of Israel as a nation-state has developed within Zionist and
Israeli discourse over the past eight decades. Nadav G. Shelef focuses on the changing ways in which the
main nationalist movements answered three distinct questions in their private and public ideological
articulations between 1925 and 2005: Where is the Land of Israel? Who ought to be Israeli? What should the
Zionist national mission be? Framed within broader debates about how and why changes in foundational
definitions of the nation occur, Shelefs analysis centers on the mechanisms of ideological change and then
subjects them to empirical scrutiny. He thus moves beyond the common but problematic assumptions that
such transformations must be either a rare, rational adaptation to traumatic shock or a relatively constant
product of manipulation by power-hungry elites. He finds that nationalist movements, including radical and
religious fundamentalist ones, can and do change cardinal components of their ideological beliefs in both
moderating and radicalizing directions. These changes have more to do with the unguided consequences of
engagement in day-to-day politics than with strategic reaction to new realities, the use of force, or the
changing incentives of leaders. Engaging with some of the most contentious debates about the nature of
Israeli nationalism and the geographic, religious, and ethnic definition of the state of Israel, Shelef has made
signal contributions to our understanding of Middle East politics and of the ideological underpinnings of
nationalism itself.
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From reader reviews:

Gracie Davis:

Throughout other case, little men and women like to read book Evolving Nationalism: Homeland, Identity,
and Religion in Israel, 1925-2005. You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. As long
as we know about how is important a book Evolving Nationalism: Homeland, Identity, and Religion in
Israel, 1925-2005. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely
right, mainly because from book you can know everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you
will end up known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we can easily
open a book or searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel weary to go
to the library. Let's learn.

Nicole Oneal:

The book Evolving Nationalism: Homeland, Identity, and Religion in Israel, 1925-2005 can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. Why must we leave the great thing like a book
Evolving Nationalism: Homeland, Identity, and Religion in Israel, 1925-2005? Several of you have a
different opinion about book. But one aim that book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely proper. Right
now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or details that you take for that, you may give for each other;
you may share all of these. Book Evolving Nationalism: Homeland, Identity, and Religion in Israel, 1925-
2005 has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and large function for you. You can seem the
enormous world by open and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Pete Dominguez:

Can you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try to pick
one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its handle may doesn't work the
following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside
seem likes. Maybe you answer could be Evolving Nationalism: Homeland, Identity, and Religion in Israel,
1925-2005 why because the fantastic cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not
disappoint you. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth
sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Cinthia Jacobsen:

Is it you who having spare time and then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just lying
down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Evolving Nationalism: Homeland, Identity, and
Religion in Israel, 1925-2005 can be the response, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are and so
out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
guides have than the others?
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