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Throughout his long, hectic and astonishingly varied life, Johann Wolfgang von Goethe (1749–1832) would
jot down his passing thoughts on theatre programmes, visiting cards, draft manuscripts and even bills …
Goethe was probably the last true ‘Renaissance Man’. Although employed as a Privy Councillor at the Duke
of Weimar’s court, where he helped oversee major mining, road-building and irrigation projects, he also
painted, directed plays, carried out research in anatomy, botany and optics – and still found time to produce
masterpieces in every literary genre. His fourteen hundred Maxims and Reflections reveal some of his
deepest thought on art, ethics, literature and natural science, but also his immediate reactions to books,
chance encounters or his administrative work. Although variable in quality, the vast majority have a
freshness and immediacy which vividly conjure up Goethe the man. They make an ideal introduction to one
of the greatest of European writers.
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From reader reviews:

Jose Miller:

As people who live in often the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era which is always change and advance. Some of you maybe will probably
update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to a person is
you don't know which one you should start with. This Maxims and Reflections (Penguin Classics) is our
recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and want
in this era.

Ian Louviere:

This Maxims and Reflections (Penguin Classics) are usually reliable for you who want to be a successful
person, why. The key reason why of this Maxims and Reflections (Penguin Classics) can be on the list of
great books you must have is giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed a person with
information that perhaps will shock your previous knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it
everywhere you go and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed versions. Beside that this Maxims
and Reflections (Penguin Classics) giving you an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you
trial run of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Estella Pierre:

The e-book untitled Maxims and Reflections (Penguin Classics) is the reserve that recommended to you to
study. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to you. The language that creator use to
explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of research
when write the book, hence the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also can get
the e-book of Maxims and Reflections (Penguin Classics) from the publisher to make you considerably more
enjoy free time.

Frances McKay:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make anyone to
understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information simpler to share.
You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You will see that
now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Often the book that recommended to you personally is
Maxims and Reflections (Penguin Classics) this book consist a lot of the information on the condition of this
world now. This particular book was represented how does the world has grown up. The words styles that
writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some study when he makes this book.
That's why this book ideal all of you.
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