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Dune House, a stunning old house right on the beach, is finally ready to be reopened as a bed and breakfast.
Best friends, Suzie and Mary, are very excited that their hard work has paid off and the opening weekend has
finally arrived. They are even more excited that they have guests booked in on opening day.

But before the B & B is officially opened Mary is distracted by a surprise guest and Suzie is distracted by her
blossoming romance with Paul. When their guests do arrive they get more than they bargained for. Not only
do they have to accommodate a very pretentious guest and an unusual guest but there is a problem with the
plumbing.

Then someone is found murdered. With the reputation of Dune House to protect, Suzie and Mary want the
murder solved quickly so they do a little investigating of their own to speed up the investigation.

What secrets does the history of Dune House hold that could lead to murder?
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From reader reviews:

Ernie Swisher:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a book.
Book has a different type. As we know that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Alongside
that you can your reading ability was fluently. A e-book Treasured History (Dune House Cozy Mystery
Series Book 3) will make you to always be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can
know about anything. But some of you think that will open or reading a new book make you bored. It isn't
make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you searching for best book or acceptable book
with you?

Charlene Martinez:

The book untitled Treasured History (Dune House Cozy Mystery Series Book 3) contain a lot of information
on this. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy technique. The language is very clear to see all the
people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read this. The book was published by famous author. The
author brings you in the new age of literary works. You can read this book because you can read on your
smart phone, or model, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book,
you can start their official web-site as well as order it. Have a nice study.

Jose Laney:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Treasured History (Dune House
Cozy Mystery Series Book 3) which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's observe.

Natalie Althoff:

Within this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more
precious than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple approach to have that.
What you should do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to experience a look at some
books. One of many books in the top collection in your reading list is usually Treasured History (Dune
House Cozy Mystery Series Book 3). This book that is qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you
closer in getting precious person. By looking up and review this reserve you can get many advantages.
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