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The opening lines of The Divine Comedy by Dante Alighieri launched Rod Dreher on a journey that
rescued him from exile and saved his life. Dreher found that the medieval poem offered him a
surprisingly practical way of solving modern problems.

Following the death of his little sister and the publication of his New York Times bestselling memoir The
Little Way of Ruthie Leming, Dreher found himself living in the small community of Starhill, Louisiana
where he grew up. But instead of the fellowship he hoped to find, he discovered that fault lines within his
family had deepened. Dreher spiraled into depression and a stress-related autoimmune disease. Doctors told
Dreher that if he didn’t find inner peace, he would destroy his health. Soon after, he came across The Divine
Comedy in a bookstore and was enchanted by its first lines, which seemed to describe his own condition.

In the months that followed Dante helped Dreher understand the mistakes and mistaken beliefs that had torn
him down and showed him that he had the power to change his life. Dreher knows firsthand the solace and
strength that can be found in Dante’s great work, and distills its wisdom for those who are lost in the dark
wood of depression, struggling with failure (or success), wrestling with a crisis of faith, alienated from their
families or communities, or otherwise enduring the sense of exile that is the human condition.

Inspiring, revelatory, and packed with penetrating spiritual, moral, and psychological insights How Dante
Can Save Your Life is a book for people, both religious and secular, who find themselves searching for
meaning and healing. Dante told his patron that he wrote his poem to bring readers from misery to happiness.
It worked for Rod Dreher. Dante saved Rod Dreher’s life—and in this book, Dreher shows you how Dante
can save yours.
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From reader reviews:

Valerie Wright:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book and
so. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a book you will get new information since book is one of many ways to share the
information or perhaps their idea. Second, reading a book will make an individual more imaginative. When
you examining a book especially fiction book the author will bring someone to imagine the story how the
character types do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other people. When you read this
How Dante Can Save Your Life: The Life-Changing Wisdom of History's Greatest Poem, you could tells
your family, friends in addition to soon about yours reserve. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make
them reading a guide.

Brooke Gafford:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book especially book entitled
How Dante Can Save Your Life: The Life-Changing Wisdom of History's Greatest Poem your brain will
drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe unfamiliar for but surely can
become your mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a reserve then become one form
conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get before. The How Dante Can Save Your Life: The Life-
Changing Wisdom of History's Greatest Poem giving you a different experience more than blown away your
brain but also giving you useful facts for your better life in this era. So now let us show you the relaxing
pattern at this point is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like
winning a game. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Luis Poole:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make anyone to
understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information easier to share. You
can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon. You will see that
now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended for you is How
Dante Can Save Your Life: The Life-Changing Wisdom of History's Greatest Poem this book consist a lot of
the information on the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how does the world
has grown up. The language styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer
made some study when he makes this book. That's why this book ideal all of you.

Wm Mills:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our expertise for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every
year ended up being exactly added. This e-book How Dante Can Save Your Life: The Life-Changing



Wisdom of History's Greatest Poem was filled regarding science. Spend your time to add your knowledge
about your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has several feel when they reading a book. If you
know how big benefit from a book, you can experience enjoy to read a e-book. In the modern era like at this
point, many ways to get book you wanted.
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