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The only volume on higher education law written specifically for nursing faculty, this volume imparts the
basic foundations of the legal, professional, and ethical issues that concern faculty on a daily basis. It clearly
defines the legal rights of students, professors, and educational institutions along with the case laws
supporting those rights. Each chapter contains a vivid legal scenario, related legal principles and theoretical
foundations, and critical thinking questions. Written by an author who is both a nurse educator and attorney,
the volume emphasizes sound decision making so that readers can successfully navigate the complex legal
issues confronting them in the faculty role.

This second edition reflects recent changes in higher education and includes an emphasis on students' rights
and safety. Chapters address the general legal rights of students with expanded content on the interplay with
social media, rights of faculty regarding freedom of speech, faculty protection against lawsuits, faculty and
the employment relationship, faculty relations, the teaching and scholarship roles of faculty, the service and
clinical practice role of faculty, and ethical considerations for patients, students, and faculty in education
environments. Appendices include information on how to read a legal case and how to research legal topics.

Key Features: 

Addresses the foundations of the legal, professional, and ethical issues that concern nursing faculty on a●

daily basis
Defines the legal rights of students, professors, and educational institutions and the case laws supporting●

those rights
Includes a legal scenario, related principles and theory, and critical thinking questions in each chapter●

Provides guidelines for legally appropriate actions and strategies to avoid legal problems●

Reflects recent changes in higher education●

Emphasizes students' rights and safety●

Author is perfectly credentialed (JD & PhD) and experienced (Professor, Dean, and experienced Attorney●

at Law) to write this book
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From reader reviews:

Tawny Morgenstern:

What do you concerning book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you really
need something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy
man? If you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster.
And you have free time? What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. They should answer that
question mainly because just their can do this. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person.
Yes, it is suitable. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this The Legal, Professional, and
Ethical Dimensions of Education in Nursing: Second Edition to read.

Agnes Henson:

This book untitled The Legal, Professional, and Ethical Dimensions of Education in Nursing: Second Edition
to be one of several books that best seller in this year, here is because when you read this guide you can get a
lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book retail store or you can order it by
way of online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book,
because you can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to
past this publication from your list.

Latoya Brown:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to select book
like comic, small story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not trying The Legal, Professional, and
Ethical Dimensions of Education in Nursing: Second Edition that give your satisfaction preference will be
satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the way for people
to know world considerably better then how they react towards the world. It can't be explained constantly
that reading routine only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for
all you who want to start looking at as your good habit, you are able to pick The Legal, Professional, and
Ethical Dimensions of Education in Nursing: Second Edition become your own personal starter.

Marcella Aragon:

You can get this The Legal, Professional, and Ethical Dimensions of Education in Nursing: Second Edition
by check out the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve issue if
you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only simply by written or
printed but also can you enjoy this book by simply e-book. In the modern era like now, you just looking
because of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get
more information about your reserve. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge
are still revise. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.
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