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This authoritative edition brings together all of Hopkins's poetry and a generous selection of his prose
writings to explore the essence of his work and thinking.

Gerard Manley Hopkins (1844-89) was one of the most innovative of nineteenth-century poets. During his
tragically short life he strove to reconcile his religious and artistic vocations, and this edition demonstrates
the range of his interests. It includes all his poetry, from best-known works such as "The Wreck of the
Deutschland" and "The Windhover" to translations, foreign language poems, plays, and verse fragments, and
the recently discovered poem "Consule Jones". In addition there are excerpts from Hopkins's journals, letters,
and spiritual writings. The poems are printed in chronological order to show Hopkins's changing
preoccupations, and all the texts have been established from original manuscripts.

About the Series: For over 100 years Oxford World's Classics has made available the broadest spectrum
of literature from around the globe. Each affordable volume reflects Oxford's commitment to scholarship,
providing the most accurate text plus a wealth of other valuable features, including expert introductions by
leading authorities, voluminous notes to clarify the text, up-to-date bibliographies for further study, and
much more.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Marshall:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive currently, people have
do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
through surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading.
Yep, by reading a reserve your ability to survive increase then having chance to endure than other is high. To
suit your needs who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this particular Gerard Manley
Hopkins: The Major Works (Oxford World's Classics) book as starter and daily reading guide. Why, because
this book is usually more than just a book.

Serafina Hayes:

The experience that you get from Gerard Manley Hopkins: The Major Works (Oxford World's Classics) is a
more deep you searching the information that hide into the words the more you get thinking about reading it.
It does not mean that this book is hard to understand but Gerard Manley Hopkins: The Major Works (Oxford
World's Classics) giving you excitement feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in certain
way that can be understood through anyone who read the idea because the author of this publication is well-
known enough. This kind of book also makes your vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to
understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for
having this specific Gerard Manley Hopkins: The Major Works (Oxford World's Classics) instantly.

Willard Sarvis:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book specifically book entitled
Gerard Manley Hopkins: The Major Works (Oxford World's Classics) your mind will drift away trough
every dimension, wandering in every single aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely will become your
mind friends. Imaging every single word written in a publication then become one application form
conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get prior to. The Gerard Manley Hopkins: The Major
Works (Oxford World's Classics) giving you an additional experience more than blown away your thoughts
but also giving you useful data for your better life on this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing
pattern this is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning
a casino game. Do you want to try this extraordinary paying spare time activity?

Luther Keller:

Some individuals said that they feel bored when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt that when they
get a half areas of the book. You can choose the particular book Gerard Manley Hopkins: The Major Works
(Oxford World's Classics) to make your reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading expertise is
developing when you like reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the
opinion about book and examining especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to available a book and



go through it. Beside that the e-book Gerard Manley Hopkins: The Major Works (Oxford World's Classics)
can to be your brand new friend when you're sense alone and confuse with the information must you're doing
of this time.
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