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R. Michael Alvarez examines how voters make their decisions in presidential elections. He begins with the
assumption that voters have neither the incentive nor the inclination to be well-informed about politics and
presidential candidates. Candidates themselves have incentives to provide ambiguous information about
themselves, their records and their issue positions. Yet the author shows that a tremendous amount of
information is made available about presidential candidates. And he uncovers clear and striking evidence that
people are not likely to vote for candidates about whom they know very little. Alvarez explores how voters
learn about candidates through the course of a campaign. He provides a detailed analysis of the media
coverage of presidential campaigns and shows that there is a tremendous amount of media coverage of these
campaigns, that much of this coverage is about issues and is informative, and that voters learn from this
coverage.
The paperback edition of this work has been updated to include information on the 1996 Presidential
election.
Information and Elections is a book that will be read by all who are interested in campaigns and electoral
behavior in presidential and other elections.
"Thoughtfully conceptualized, painstakingly analyzed, with empirically significant conclusions on
presidential election voting behavior, this book is recommended for both upper-division undergraduate and
graduate collections." --Choice
R. Michael Alvarez is Associate Professor of Political Science, California Institute of Technology.
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From reader reviews:

John McKenzie:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, short story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not hoping Information and
Elections (Michigan Studies in Political Analysis) that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied
by simply reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to
know world far better then how they react to the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading habit
only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all of you who want to
start reading as your good habit, you can pick Information and Elections (Michigan Studies in Political
Analysis) become your own personal starter.

Jacob Keys:

The book untitled Information and Elections (Michigan Studies in Political Analysis) contain a lot of
information on the idea. The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy approach. The language is very
clear and understandable all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read this. The book was
published by famous author. The author provides you in the new period of time of literary works. You can
actually read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book
inside anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can start their official web-site along with
order it. Have a nice examine.

William Oden:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every
year had been exactly added. This reserve Information and Elections (Michigan Studies in Political Analysis)
was filled about science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your scientific research
competence. Some people has several feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big good thing
about a book, you can experience enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like currently, many ways to
get book that you simply wanted.

Martha Royal:

Some people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a publication. They are directly felt that
when they get a half areas of the book. You can choose the actual book Information and Elections (Michigan
Studies in Political Analysis) to make your reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading ability is
developing when you just like reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy you just read
it and mingle the sensation about book and reading especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to
available a book and examine it. Beside that the publication Information and Elections (Michigan Studies in
Political Analysis) can to be your brand-new friend when you're really feel alone and confuse in doing what



must you're doing of the time.
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