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When party guests request a few tricks, be prepared. Ask for a coin, and perform some of the tricks in this
book. Because you will not have been aided by special stage apparatus, the results will be all the more
astonishing. As tricks with coins are so readily improvised, they are among the most impressive forms of
legerdemain.
This book is the most complete treatise ever written on sleight-of-hand coin conjuring. Celebrated magician
J. B. Bobo has gathered here the best and most useful of all coin tricks — not only his own, but those of
some four dozen notable prestidigitators, including such greats as Robert-Houdin, Professer Hoffman, and —
the greatest of all coin conjurers — T. Nelson Downs.
All the tested, traditional methods of coin magic are here. Bobo has added to these the best of the modern
innovations, while eliminating all of the out-of-date and impractical sleights of his sources. You will learn all
about palms, holds, flips, switches, change-over, steals, cuffing, sleeving, and other sleight-of-hand
techniques; coin tricks requiring special devices are also included. The author guides how systematically
from basic techniques, concealments, and vanishes, through integrated tricks, to complete routine acts (18 in
all). His clear explanations are splendidly complemented by 510 of Nelson C. Hahne's crisp illustrations.
Sleight-of-hand magic has consistently earned the respect of professional magicians. If you are yet an
amateur, this easy-to-follow manual — together with regular practice — is the surest route to professional-
level competence. For professionals, this volume is a convenient encyclopedic reference that gathers in one
place all the best coin magic from antiquity to modern times.
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From reader reviews:

Mary York:

Do you one among people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on
guys this particular aren't like that. This Modern Coin Magic: 116 Coin Sleights and 236 Coin Tricks with
510 Illustrations book is readable by you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the information here
are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to
provide to you. The writer connected with Modern Coin Magic: 116 Coin Sleights and 236 Coin Tricks with
510 Illustrations content conveys objective easily to understand by lots of people. The printed and e-book are
not different in the information but it just different such as it. So , do you even now thinking Modern Coin
Magic: 116 Coin Sleights and 236 Coin Tricks with 510 Illustrations is not loveable to be your top collection
reading book?

Marni Elliott:

The book Modern Coin Magic: 116 Coin Sleights and 236 Coin Tricks with 510 Illustrations will bring you
to definitely the new experience of reading a book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. If
you try to find new book to study, this book very appropriate to you. The book Modern Coin Magic: 116
Coin Sleights and 236 Coin Tricks with 510 Illustrations is much recommended to you to read. You can also
get the e-book from the official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Kara Navarrete:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world could share their idea.
Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire their very own reader with their story or
maybe their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the
ability about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your young
ones, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their
skill in writing, they also doing some research before they write with their book. One of them is this Modern
Coin Magic: 116 Coin Sleights and 236 Coin Tricks with 510 Illustrations.

Randi Adams:

Beside that Modern Coin Magic: 116 Coin Sleights and 236 Coin Tricks with 510 Illustrations in your
phone, it may give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the
knowledge you will got here is fresh through the oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an older
people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Modern Coin Magic: 116 Coin Sleights and 236
Coin Tricks with 510 Illustrations because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you
often have book but you do not get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this
inside your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, such as treasuring beautiful island. Use



you still want to miss this? Find this book and read it from currently!
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