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The "new grownup" guide to managing your life and money in the modern economy

No One Ever Told Us That is a series of essential life and financial lessons that every adult needs to read
before they embark upon their own life's adventures. You've completed your education, your couch surfing,
and your internships—now it's time to grow up. You have a "real" job, maybe a family, and maybe a
mortgage; but you've been launched into an uncertain world. This book is your much-needed guide to life as
an adult, giving you the answers you need about becoming a professional, becoming financially secure, and
becoming your own person. You see the world differently when you spend your days supporting yourself
and your family, and money management quickly becomes an integral part of everything you do. This useful
guide shows you how to do what you need to do, find the people you need on your side, and fulfill your
obligations to those who matter most to you.

You may have been used to the idea of "independence" for a while by now, but when the reality of it hits,
many new adults are thrown into a sudden state of panic. This book is your guide through the storm, your
handbook for adulthood, and your personal companion for the journey ahead.

John D. Spooner has a dual life. He has been named by Barrons as one of the top 100 financial advisors in●

America. As an author, the great mystery writer Robert B. Parker has said, "John Spooner is, quite simply,
one of the best writers in America."
Gain a fresh perspective on the world as a grownup●

Meet financial challenges with smart money management●

Assemble your personal, legal, medical, and financial support team●

Learn essential lessons before you suffer their consequences●

Written by the only full-time writer and money manager in America●

Nothing in your experience has ever prepared you for the responsibility of responsibility. You've been
thrown into the deep end, the undertow is strong, and the stakes are high—it's time to start swimming. No
One Ever Told Us That gets you right on track to your brightest future.
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From reader reviews:

Penny Laughlin:

The book No One Ever Told Us That: Money and Life Lessons for Young Adults can give more knowledge
and also the precise product information about everything you want. Why must we leave the good thing like
a book No One Ever Told Us That: Money and Life Lessons for Young Adults? Several of you have a
different opinion about book. But one aim that book can give many info for us. It is absolutely appropriate.
Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you may give for
each other; you may share all of these. Book No One Ever Told Us That: Money and Life Lessons for Young
Adults has simple shape but you know: it has great and big function for you. You can search the enormous
world by start and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Virginia Berry:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be up-date about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era which can be always change and move forward. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the
problems coming to you is you don't know which one you should start with. This No One Ever Told Us
That: Money and Life Lessons for Young Adults is our recommendation to make you keep up with the
world. Why, as this book serves what you want and want in this era.

Sebrina Knapp:

As a university student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or
make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's soul or
real their hobby. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we
know that on this era, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore , this No One Ever Told Us That: Money and Life Lessons for Young Adults
can make you feel more interested to read.

Kathy Davis:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got pupils? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. And also you
know that little person including reading or as studying become their hobby. You have to know that reading
is very important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update with regards to something by book. Different
categories of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is niagra No One Ever Told Us
That: Money and Life Lessons for Young Adults.
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