
Psychological Experts in Divorce Actions
Marc J., Ph.D. Ackerman, Andrew W., Ph.D. Kane

Click here if your download doesn"t start automatically

http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1567069223
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1567069223
http://zonebook.me/go/read.php?id=1567069223


Psychological Experts in Divorce Actions

Marc J., Ph.D. Ackerman, Andrew W., Ph.D. Kane

Psychological Experts in Divorce Actions Marc J., Ph.D. Ackerman, Andrew W., Ph.D. Kane

Emotionally charged issues abound in matrimonial practice, especially in custody disputes. Expert
testimony can have a dramatic impact on the outcome of a case, and when matters are highly sensitive or
sensational the seeming objectivity of an expert can be dispositive. To effectively reinforce or question that
testimony, certain specialized knowledge is essential. Scientifically accepted standards and theories are
constantly evolving. Keeping up with the data had been a challenge, but one integrated resource has made it
simple.

Aspen Publishers’ Psychological Experts in Divorce Actions pulls all the research together into the
definitive guide to understanding the role of psychological evaluations in divorce and custody actions.
Focused on providing the best approach to protecting your client’s interests, this work explains all the
leading testing instruments,what conclusions may be drawn and how to challenge or support those
conclusions. In addition to offering effective examination and cross-examination strategies, it assists you in
handling the gamut of psychological factors that affect clients in divorce  and custody cases.

Authors Marc J. Ackerman, Ph.D., and Andrew W. Kane, Ph.D., are licensed psychologists who have
been involved in hundreds of custody cases. Drawing on their extensive experience—testing parties to a 
divorce and treating psychological patients in the clinic—and as psychological experts in the courtroom,
they identify the most important psychological evaluation research used in divorce and custody decision-
making and distill the information into clear terms lawyers can readily apply.They also examine vital issues
including:

Ethics—confidentiality, privilege, duty to warn or protect (Tarasoff), sharing raw data, test integrity●

Sexual abuse—bona fide or fabricated allegations, psychological effects of sexual abuse, profiles of abuser●

and abused
Testing—personality tests (including MMPI-2, and the new MMPI-2-RF, Rorschach,Millon,TAT);●

intelligence tests (Wechsler scales,Kaufman scales, Stanford Binet); custody tests (ASPECT, PCRI, PASS,
BPS); and many more
How divorce affects families—custody, placement, age and gender differences, grandparents, sexual●

preference, psychological problems
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From reader reviews:

Eric Butler:

The book Psychological Experts in Divorce Actions can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the best thing like a book Psychological
Experts in Divorce Actions? Wide variety you have a different opinion about book. But one aim in which
book can give many details for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with your book.
Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you may give for each other; you can share all of these. Book
Psychological Experts in Divorce Actions has simple shape but you know: it has great and large function for
you. You can appear the enormous world by available and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Ruth Williams:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. To
be sure that book is very important normally. The book Psychological Experts in Divorce Actions was
making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It doesn't matter
what advantages for you. The e-book Psychological Experts in Divorce Actions is not only giving you
considerably more new information but also to be your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend
your own personal spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship with all the book Psychological
Experts in Divorce Actions. You never feel lose out for everything when you read some books.

Andrew Nixon:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not involve people to be aware of each info they get. How a lot more to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Studying a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Psychological Experts in
Divorce Actions book since this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the information in this
book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Tracy Brown:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try to and must have the extra time or they will get great
deal of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely yes. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to you of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever try
this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the book you have
read is usually Psychological Experts in Divorce Actions.
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