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Rufinus' vivid account of the battle between the Eastern Emperor Theodosius and the Western usurper
Eugenius by the River Frigidus in 394 represents it as the final confrontation between paganism and
Christianity. It is indeed widely believed that a largely pagan aristocracy remained a powerful and active
force well into the fifth century, sponsoring pagan literary circles, patronage of the classics, and propaganda
for the old cults in art and literature. The main focus of much modern scholarship on the end of paganism in
the West has been on its supposed stubborn resistance to Christianity. The dismantling of this romantic myth
is one of the main goals of Alan Cameron's book. Actually, the book argues, Western paganism petered out
much earlier and more rapidly than hitherto assumed.

The subject of this book is not the conversion of the last pagans but rather the duration, nature, and
consequences of their survival. By re-examining the abundant textual evidence, both Christian (Ambrose,
Augustine, Jerome, Paulinus, Prudentius) and "pagan" (Claudian, Macrobius, and Ammianus Marcellinus),
as well as the visual evidence (ivory diptychs, illuminated manuscripts, silverware), Cameron shows that
most of the activities and artifacts previously identified as hallmarks of a pagan revival were in fact just as
important to the life of cultivated Christians. Far from being a subversive activity designed to rally pagans,
the acceptance of classical literature, learning, and art by most elite Christians may actually have helped the
last reluctant pagans to finally abandon the old cults and adopt Christianity. The culmination of decades of
research, The Last Pagans of Rome overturns many long-held assumptions about pagan and Christian culture
in the late antique West.
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer McNab:

Here thing why this specific The Last Pagans of Rome are different and trusted to be yours. First of all
examining a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content of the usb ports which is the content is as
tasty as food or not. The Last Pagans of Rome giving you information deeper since different ways, you can
find any guide out there but there is no e-book that similar with The Last Pagans of Rome. It gives you thrill
examining journey, its open up your personal eyes about the thing that happened in the world which is
possibly can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere like in recreation area, café, or
even in your way home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the form
of The Last Pagans of Rome in e-book can be your choice.

Clifford Harvey:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also work as a life style. This reading behavior
give you lot of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside
the book which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want really
feel happy read one using theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Often the The Last Pagans of
Rome is kind of guide which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Cora Spillane:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, brief story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not striving The Last Pagans of Rome that
give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world can
be said as the opportinity for people to know world far better then how they react to the world. It can't be
explained constantly that reading habit only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to possibly
be success person. So , for all of you who want to start examining as your good habit, it is possible to pick
The Last Pagans of Rome become your personal starter.

Jolene Rivera:

Beside that The Last Pagans of Rome in your phone, it might give you a way to get more close to the new
knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from your oven so
don't possibly be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have The Last
Pagans of Rome because this book offers to you readable information. Do you occasionally have book but
you would not get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this in the hand.
The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want
to miss the idea? Find this book and read it from today!
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