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He's the most secretive member of the Royal Elite. A man with a past; a past that comes back to haunt him at
an inopportune time. During a mission in Ankara, in the midst of a rescue operation, Leander discovers that
the secrets he's kept for so long are about to come out in the open. Secrets that may jeopardize his life and his
relationship to the only woman he's ever loved.

Wynn Hudson knows her fiance does daring and dangerous things. She just doesn't realize how dangerous
until she overhears a pertinent conversation that leaves no doubt of Leander's involvement. Just as she's
about to set off across the world to confront the situation head on, she intercepts a disturbing letter that alters
the course of her journey. Teaming up with her best friend Chey, Wynn strikes out to uncover Leander's
past—and secrets that threaten to tear them apart.
* * * *
The Royal Elite is a spinoff series from the Latvala Royals.

The Royals:
Heir Untamed
King and Kingdom
Heir in Exile
The King Takes A Bride
The Wrath of the King

The Royal Elite:
Mattias
Ahsan
Chayton
Leander
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From reader reviews:

Jonathan Scott:

This The Royal Elite: Leander book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your
hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book is usually information inside this publication incredible
fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper you actually read a lot of information you will get. That The
Royal Elite: Leander without we recognize teach the one who studying it become critical in pondering and
analyzing. Don't be worry The Royal Elite: Leander can bring if you are and not make your tote space or
bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This The
Royal Elite: Leander having excellent arrangement in word in addition to layout, so you will not feel
uninterested in reading.

Donald Wexler:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information today can get by anyone on everywhere. The
information can be a understanding or any news even a concern. What people must be consider while those
information which is within the former life are difficult to be find than now is taking seriously which one
works to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource then you
buy it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities will not
happen inside you if you take The Royal Elite: Leander as your daily resource information.

Jerry Schooler:

The book untitled The Royal Elite: Leander contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains the
woman idea with easy means. The language is very simple to implement all the people, so do not really
worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was authored by famous author. The author will bring you in
the new age of literary works. You can read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or
device, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can
start their official web-site and order it. Have a nice read.

Robert Vargas:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many concern for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book but also novel and The Royal Elite: Leander or perhaps others
sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel wish to read
more and more. Science book was created for teacher or even students especially. Those publications are
helping them to include their knowledge. In different case, beside science reserve, any other book likes The
Royal Elite: Leander to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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