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Amyotrophic Lateral Sclerosis: A Patient Care Guide for Clinicians is a practical reference for clinicians
caring for ALS patients that brings together the collective wisdom of those at the forefront of patient-
oriented research and practice. The book compiles recent findings of both evidence-based and experience-
based research to provide clinicians with tools that improve quality and length of life for people with ALS.

To present a truly multidisciplinary approach to ALS, this book mirrors the organization of a large clinic
with separate departments working collaboratively. It begins with a review of current understandings of ALS
including diagnostic criteria, genetic and sporadic subtypes, epidemiology, co-morbidities, and prognosis.
From there the book is divided into chapters that include neurological assessment, nursing care and
coordination, speech and swallowing interventions, nutrition and nutrition therapy, physical therapy,
occupational therapy, respiratory therapy, assistive technology, social work practice related to ALS, and
web-based resources. Each chapter is led by experts from that discipline who review evidence- and
experience-based care options. In addition, the entire North American ALS Research Group (ALSRG) has
had a chance to weigh in as well, making this a unique and well-rounded resource. The book addresses
everything from breaking the news of an ALS diagnosis to end-of-life care and bereavement. By putting
experts in conversation with each other, both within and across individual disciplines, Amyotrophic Lateral
Sclerosis: A Patient Care Guide for Clinicians provides comprehensive, real-world care information that
canÌt be found anywhere else.

Amyotrophic Lateral Sclerosis features:

A practical reference for all members of the ALS care team, covering everything from breaking the news to●

end-of-life care and bereavement
Chapters that mirror the organization of large multi-disciplinary ALS clinics and include pertinent●

information for each member of the care team
Evidence- and experience-based findings provide current scientific and clinical consensus and a forum for●

real-world care options
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From reader reviews:

Marcus Musick:

Book is actually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can realize everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Adjacent to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A guide Amyotrophic Lateral Sclerosis: A
Patient Care Guide for Clinicians will make you to always be smarter. You can feel more confidence if you
can know about everything. But some of you think that open or reading a new book make you bored. It isn't
make you fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or suitable book with
you?

Elizabeth Hart:

The knowledge that you get from Amyotrophic Lateral Sclerosis: A Patient Care Guide for Clinicians is the
more deep you digging the information that hide into the words the more you get enthusiastic about reading
it. It does not mean that this book is hard to recognise but Amyotrophic Lateral Sclerosis: A Patient Care
Guide for Clinicians giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in
selected way that can be understood through anyone who read this because the author of this publication is
well-known enough. That book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to
understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you
for having this particular Amyotrophic Lateral Sclerosis: A Patient Care Guide for Clinicians instantly.

Jason Ayers:

The reserve with title Amyotrophic Lateral Sclerosis: A Patient Care Guide for Clinicians contains a lot of
information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This specific book
exist new knowledge the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world at this
point. That is important to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you
throughout new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can
read that anywhere you want.

Cierra Persaud:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book but in addition novel and Amyotrophic Lateral Sclerosis: A Patient
Care Guide for Clinicians or maybe others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how
the truly great a book, you feel wish to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or
perhaps students especially. Those publications are helping them to put their knowledge. In various other
case, beside science publication, any other book likes Amyotrophic Lateral Sclerosis: A Patient Care Guide
for Clinicians to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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