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• Sullivan has nearly 100% name recognition among people 40 and older

• In a survey of the fifty most influential programs in the U.S., TV Guide ranked The Ed Sullivan Show #10

• Show still appears on PBS and on cable stations across the country

• Sixty million baby boomers grew up watching The Ed Sullivan Show

For more than twenty years, from 1948 to 1971, fifty-five million viewers watched The Ed Sullivan Show
religiously every Sunday night. Everyone who was anyone appeared—the Beatles and Elvis, of course, and
Woody Allen, Bill Cosby, and Elizabeth Taylor, plus public figures such as Fidel Castro, David Ben-Gurion,
and Martin Luther King, Jr. More than thirty years later, the program remains a pop-culture icon. But despite
Ed Sullivan’s prominence, little was known about the private man...until now. Impresario reveals what the
Sullivan viewers never saw: nasty, hot-tempered, craven, yet also capable of high ideals and, above all,
hugely ambitious. At a time when Americans are looking back, The Ed Sullivan Show stands out as a
shining example of television during the golden era. Impresario lets readers look behind the screen to see
the man who made it happen.
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From reader reviews:

Dorothy Pearce:

The book Impresario: The Life and Times of Ed Sullivan make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You
should use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting
strain or having big problem with the subject. If you can make reading through a book Impresario: The Life
and Times of Ed Sullivan to be your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your capable, increase
your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You may know everything if you like wide open and read a book
Impresario: The Life and Times of Ed Sullivan. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science guide or
encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Miriam Normandin:

Book is to be different for every grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As it is known to
us that book is very important for us. The book Impresario: The Life and Times of Ed Sullivan was making
you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for
you. The publication Impresario: The Life and Times of Ed Sullivan is not only giving you much more new
information but also being your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time
to read your book. Try to make relationship while using book Impresario: The Life and Times of Ed
Sullivan. You never sense lose out for everything if you read some books.

Danielle Hawkins:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading routine give
you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book
this improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of reserve you read, if
you want drive more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want truly feel happy read one
together with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Often the Impresario: The Life and Times of Ed
Sullivan is kind of book which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Nancy Barry:

This book untitled Impresario: The Life and Times of Ed Sullivan to be one of several books that best seller
in this year, this is because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily to
buy that book in the book shop or you can order it by way of online. The publisher on this book sells the e-
book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, as you can read this book in your Cell phone. So there is no
reason to you to past this book from your list.
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