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".... From cover design, interior page layout, to the rich content itself, Self-Publishing for Virgins is...a
valuable resource for any writer. It will help even experienced authors with previously published books to be
aware of new options in the radically changing world of publishing." Dan Miller Author of 48 Days To The
Work You Love " Peggy DeKay is the Goldilocks of self-publishing. Some books leave me asking questions,
some books provide so much information my eyes roll back into my head. This book is just enough
information to be thorough, without overwhelming me..." Self Publishing for Virgins is the definitive, first-
time author’s guide to self publishing your book using CreateSpace and print-on-demand technology. Learn
how to maximize profits! Self Publishing for Virgins takes the worry out of self publishing. Learn how to: -
Set the right price for your book -Effective book promotion -Make the most of Amazon’s Author Central -
Create a great author website -Turn your book into multiple streams of income -Get a Library of Congress
number and an ISBN -Write a great press release -Market your book before you publish -Copyright -Avoid
the costly mistakes Here’s what’s inside: -Tutorial on interior book layout with Word -Createspace website
tutorial -Social media for writers -Blogging and podcasting for writers "Your book is not your baby...your
book is your business." Peggy DeKay
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From reader reviews:

Linda Caron:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get
large amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to you of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try
this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the particular book you have
read will be Self-Publishing for Virgins: The First Time Author's Guide to Self Publishing.

Joey Mendoza:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make someone to
understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information much easier to share.
You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You will observe
that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Typically the book that recommended for you
is Self-Publishing for Virgins: The First Time Author's Guide to Self Publishing this publication consist a lot
of the information from the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how do the
world has grown up. The language styles that writer value to explain it is easy to understand. The actual
writer made some investigation when he makes this book. Here is why this book suited all of you.

Joel Barnhardt:

This Self-Publishing for Virgins: The First Time Author's Guide to Self Publishing is completely new way
for you who has fascination to look for some information as it relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you
into it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having little bit of digest in reading this
Self-Publishing for Virgins: The First Time Author's Guide to Self Publishing can be the light food for you
because the information inside that book is easy to get through anyone. These books develop itself in the
form which is reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book contact form. People who think that in reserve
form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a book
especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for an individual. So , don't miss it!
Just read this e-book sort for your better life in addition to knowledge.

Laverne Dunbar:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen will need book to know the revise information of year to be able to year. As we
know those textbooks have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around
the world. With the book Self-Publishing for Virgins: The First Time Author's Guide to Self Publishing we
can consider more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? To get creative person must love to read
a book. Just choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't always be doubt to change your life



at this book Self-Publishing for Virgins: The First Time Author's Guide to Self Publishing. You can more
inviting than now.
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