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What do ghost hunting, legend tripping, and legendary monsters have in common with email hoaxes, chain
letters, and horror movies? In this follow-up to Libraries Unlimited's Tales, Rumors, and Gossip: Exploring
Contemporary Folk Literature in Grades 7–12, author Gail de Vos revisits popular urban legends, and
examines the impact of media—online, social, and broadcast—on their current iterations.

What Happens Next? Contemporary Urban Legends and Popular Culture traces the evolution of
contemporary legends from the tradition of oral storytelling to the sharing of stories on the Internet and TV.
The author examines if the popularity of contemporary legends in the media has changed the form, role, and
integrity of familiar legends. In addition to revisiting some of the legends highlighted in her first book, de
Vos shares new tales in circulation which she sees as a direct result of technological advancements.
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From reader reviews:

Ella Butler:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? That's why, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or read a book allowed What Happens Next?:
Contemporary Urban Legends and Popular Culture? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You recognize
beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do
you agree with its opinion or you have some other opinion?

Shanika Jeans:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive right now, people have
do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice
by simply surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
Sure, by reading a guide your ability to survive boost then having chance to stand than other is high. For you
personally who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you that What Happens Next?:
Contemporary Urban Legends and Popular Culture book as beginner and daily reading book. Why, because
this book is greater than just a book.

John Smithers:

The publication untitled What Happens Next?: Contemporary Urban Legends and Popular Culture is the
reserve that recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the publication content that will
be shown to anyone. The language that author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The
article author was did a lot of research when write the book, so the information that they share to your
account is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of What Happens Next?: Contemporary Urban
Legends and Popular Culture from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Raymond Dixon:

What Happens Next?: Contemporary Urban Legends and Popular Culture can be one of your nice books that
are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that can
increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information.
The author giving his/her effort to set every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing What Happens
Next?: Contemporary Urban Legends and Popular Culture but doesn't forget the main place, giving the
reader the hottest as well as based confirm resource data that maybe you can be considered one of it. This
great information can certainly drawn you into completely new stage of crucial imagining.
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