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The first edition of The Economist Guide to Investment Strategy explained the fundamentals of investment
risk, how to put together "keep-it-simple" investment strategies, and the need to guard against our own
behavior leading to dreadful investment mistakes. The global crisis that erupted in 2008 exposed the flaws in
many more complicated investment strategies.

The second edition starts with a new section on financial fraud and how investors can help to protect
themselves against this "hearty perennial."  It also includes a new section on risk profiling and discusses the
role of risk tolerance questionnaires. In Chapter 3 data are provided pointing to underperformance of equities
between 1978 and 2008. Against this background, there is a new Chapter 4—"Which should we do: buy-
and-hold or time markets?" Chapter 5, which discusses the design of short-term and long-term strategies,
includes a new section—"How safe is cash?"—and the discussion of bond ladders is extended to reflect
issues of bond selection in the light of corporate credit risk and the financial difficulties of some US
municipal authorities.

Part 2 has been updated extensively to reflect developments in the past four years and the impact of the
financial crisis on credit instruments, hedge funds, private equity, and real estate.

The book concludes with a new chapter on investing in art and collectibles. It explores the argument that art
prices "float aimlessly," discusses financial investment in art, and provides some reasons for expecting that a
portfolio of art might perform well in the future.
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From reader reviews:

Colleen Williams:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled Guide to Investment Strategy: How to Understand Markets, Risk, Rewards
and Behaviour. Try to make book Guide to Investment Strategy: How to Understand Markets, Risk, Rewards
and Behaviour as your close friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you really feel alone and
beside that course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book
makes you considerably more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , we should
make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Rebecca Muldoon:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each details they get. How people have to
be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Reading a
book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Guide to Investment Strategy:
How to Understand Markets, Risk, Rewards and Behaviour book as this book offers you rich details and
knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody
knows.

Mary Fox:

Reading can called mind hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book mainly book entitled Guide to
Investment Strategy: How to Understand Markets, Risk, Rewards and Behaviour the mind will drift away
trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe unidentified for but surely can become your
mind friends. Imaging just about every word written in a reserve then become one contact form conclusion
and explanation this maybe you never get prior to. The Guide to Investment Strategy: How to Understand
Markets, Risk, Rewards and Behaviour giving you a different experience more than blown away your head
but also giving you useful data for your better life in this particular era. So now let us teach you the relaxing
pattern is your body and mind are going to be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a sport.
Do you want to try this extraordinary spending spare time activity?

Sandra Easley:

Reading a book to get new life style in this yr; every people loves to go through a book. When you examine a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, because
book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that
you have read. In order to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if you act
like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, in



addition to soon. The Guide to Investment Strategy: How to Understand Markets, Risk, Rewards and
Behaviour provide you with new experience in looking at a book.
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