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SAM DOLAN is a young man coming to terms with his life in the process and aftermath of making his first
film. He has a difficult relationship with his father, B-movie actor Booth Dolan—a boisterous, opinionated,
lying lothario whose screen legacy falls somewhere between cult hero and pathetic. Allie, Sam’s dearly
departed mother, was a woman whose only fault, in Sam’s eyes, was her eternal affection for his father. Also
included in the cast of indelible characters: a precocious, frequently violent half-sister; a conspiracy-theorist
second wife; an Internet-famous roommate; a contractor who can’t stop expanding his house; a happy-go-
lucky college girlfriend and her husband, a retired Yankees catcher; the morose producer of a true-crime
show; and a slouching indie-film legend. Not to mention a tragic sex monster.

Unraveling the tumultuous, decades-spanning story of the Dolan family’s friends, lovers, and adversaries,
Double Feature is about letting go of everything—regret, resentment, dignity, moving pictures, the
dead—and taking it again from the top. Against the backdrop of indie filmmaking, college campus life,
contemporary Brooklyn, and upstate New York, Owen King’s epic debut novel combines propulsive
storytelling with mordant wit and brims with a deep understanding of the trials of ambition and art, of
relationships and life, and of our attempts to survive it all.
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From reader reviews:

Sean Scruggs:

This Double Feature: A Novel book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in
your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is actually information inside this reserve incredible
fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. That Double
Feature: A Novel without we understand teach the one who examining it become critical in considering and
analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Double Feature: A Novel can bring when you are and not make your tote
space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even cell phone. This Double
Feature: A Novel having fine arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not sense uninterested in
reading.

Kathleen Jones:

Typically the book Double Feature: A Novel has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you check out this book
you can get a lot of help. The book was written by the very famous author. Tom makes some research just
before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after looking
over this book.

Kyle Smallwood:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. One particular activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Double Feature: A Novel, it is
possible to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it?
Oh come on its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Wilda Baeza:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This book Double Feature: A Novel was colourful and of course has
pictures on there. As we know that book Double Feature: A Novel has many kinds or style. Start from kids
until youngsters. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and think you are the character on
there. Therefore not at all of book are make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try
to choose the best book for you and try to like reading that.
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