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Prussia's last king and Germany's last Kaiser was born in Potsdam on January 27, 1859, the son of Prince
Frederick of Prussia and Princess Vicky, Queen Victoria's eldest child. William was born with a withered
arm and suffered from cerebral palsy; many historians have sought in this clue a clue to his behavior later in
life. He was believed mad by some, eccentric by others. Possessed of a ferocious temper, he was prone to
reactionary statements, often contradicted by his next action or utterance. He was rumored to have sired
numerous illegitimate children and yet was by all appearances a prig. A severe Calvinist tutor brought him
up, but his entourage spoiled him, allowing him to win at games an maneuvers to compensate for his
deformities. This gave him a sense of inherent invincibility.

William became Kaiser at age twenty-nine. Two years later, he drove Bismarck out after the latter had
blocked his social policy. He destabilized the Iron Chancellor's foreign policy by failing to renew the
Reinsurance Treaty with Russia, a decision that opened the way for Russia's alliance with France in 1894. He
denied that the fleet he built was targeted at Britain, but there is evidence that German domination of the seas
was the aim of William's secretary of state, who was altogether less anxious to please the British than the
grandson of Queen Victoria. William idolized the Queen. As soon as he heard she was dying, he rushed to
Osbourne House to be at her bedside. his own daughter later said, "The Queen of England died in the arms of
the German Kaiser."

William II is widely perceived as a warmonger who seemed to delight in power grabbing, blood-shed, and
the belligerent aims of his staff, yet the image he carved out for himself and posterity was that of "emperor of
peace." William has historically been blamed for World War I, although he made real efforts to prevent the
conflict. he has been branded an anti-Semite, but ironically the Nazis wrote him off as a "Jew-lover." In this
fascinating, authoritative new biography, MacDonogh, widely praised for his life of Frederick the Great,
takes a fresh look at this complex and contradictory statesmen and the charges against him to find that
a=many can no longer be upheld.
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From reader reviews:

James Batts:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on
guys this particular aren't like that. This The Last Kaiser: The Life of Wilhelm II book is readable by simply
you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable reading through
experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer of The Last
Kaiser: The Life of Wilhelm II content conveys prospect easily to understand by many people. The printed
and e-book are not different in the content but it just different in the form of it. So , do you even now
thinking The Last Kaiser: The Life of Wilhelm II is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Tammie Jackson:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 as well as 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind talent
or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as compared to
can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this all time you only find reserve that need more
time to be read. The Last Kaiser: The Life of Wilhelm II can be your answer since it can be read by an
individual who have those short spare time problems.

Wm Mills:

You may get this The Last Kaiser: The Life of Wilhelm II by look at the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing
or reviewing it may to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are
various. Not only by means of written or printed but also can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern
era similar to now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now,
choose your own personal ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange
yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.

Darlene Kidd:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your preferred book? Or your book ended up being
rare? Why so many query for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some
people likes studying, not only science book but novel and The Last Kaiser: The Life of Wilhelm II or
maybe others sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel
need to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those
ebooks are helping them to bring their knowledge. In additional case, beside science reserve, any other book
likes The Last Kaiser: The Life of Wilhelm II to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many
types of book like this.
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