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What is a national medicine? What does it mean for a medicine to be traditional and scientific at the same
time? How could a specifically Vietnamese medicine emerge out of the medical practices and treatments that
have flourished and waned during key socio-cultural encounters in Vietnam? This book answers these
questions by examining the making of Vietnamese medicine from a historical and contemporary perspective.
Ever since its 14th century emergence out of the traditions and practices of the much more globally
celebrated Chinese medicine, Vietnamese medicine has been engaged in a constant effort to define, guard
and more recently, revive itself. In this collection of empirically-rich chapters, international scholars
specialising in history, sociology, anthropology and medicine show how this process has played out through
very much ongoing North-South and West-East encounters. Vietnamese medicine is practiced, produced and
consumed in contexts of medical pluralism and globalisation, not only within Vietnam, but increasingly also
among Vietnamese diaspora around the world. Its development and modernisation cannot be detached from
Vietnam's tumultuous and tragic quest for independence. The compass points that saturate every chapter in
this volume suggest that the making of Vietnamese medicine has been as much related to post-colonial
national identity formation as it has to national efforts to address the health problems of the Vietnamese
people.
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From reader reviews:

Angela Heller:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or goal; it means that reserve
has different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they have because their hobby is actually reading a book. How about the person who don't like
studying a book? Sometime, individual feel need book after they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise.
Well, probably you should have this Southern Medicine for Southern People: Vietnamese Medicine in the
Making.

Wendell Darnell:

The reserve untitled Southern Medicine for Southern People: Vietnamese Medicine in the Making is the
guide that recommended to you to see. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown
to an individual. The language that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The article author was did a lot of analysis when write the book, therefore the information that
they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of Southern Medicine for Southern
People: Vietnamese Medicine in the Making from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Bertha Montes:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, small story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping Southern Medicine for Southern
People: Vietnamese Medicine in the Making that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied through
reading this book. Reading routine all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world much
better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading routine
only for the geeky man but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all of you who want to
start studying as your good habit, you are able to pick Southern Medicine for Southern People: Vietnamese
Medicine in the Making become your starter.

Cynthia Briscoe:

Beside this particular Southern Medicine for Southern People: Vietnamese Medicine in the Making in your
phone, it could give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or data. The information and the
knowledge you may got here is fresh from oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an old people live
in narrow community. It is good thing to have Southern Medicine for Southern People: Vietnamese
Medicine in the Making because this book offers for you readable information. Do you often have book but
you seldom get what it's about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable
set up here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss the idea? Find
this book and read it from at this point!
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