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In this radical new interpretation of Plato's Meno, Roslyn Weiss exposes the farcical nature of the slave-boy-
demonstration and challenges the widely held assumption that the Meno introduces "Platonic" metaphysical
and epistemological innovations into an otherwise "Socratic" dialogue. She shows that the Meno is intended
as a defense not of all inquiry but of moral inquiry alone, and that it locates the validity of Socratic method in
its ability to arrive not at moral knowledge but at the far more modest moral true belief.

Through a careful, and provocative, reading of Plato's Meno, Weiss identifies serious problems in its
orthodox interpretations, offering an alternative that is responsive to the dialogue's drama. Virtue in the Cave
will appeal not only to students of ancient philosophy and the classics, but also to anyone who is interested in
how to live right in a world of moral uncertainty.
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From reader reviews:

Mark Giordano:

The book Virtue in the Cave: Moral Inquiry in Plato's Meno can give more knowledge and also the precise
product information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the great thing like a book Virtue
in the Cave: Moral Inquiry in Plato's Meno? Some of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim
which book can give many info for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer with the book.
Knowledge or info that you take for that, you can give for each other; you could share all of these. Book
Virtue in the Cave: Moral Inquiry in Plato's Meno has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and
big function for you. You can look the enormous world by start and read a publication. So it is very
wonderful.

Irene Gamino:

Do you among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on guys this
particular aren't like that. This Virtue in the Cave: Moral Inquiry in Plato's Meno book is readable by simply
you who hate those straight word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable reading
experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to offer to you. The writer connected with
Virtue in the Cave: Moral Inquiry in Plato's Meno content conveys the idea easily to understand by a lot of
people. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but it just different by means of it. So , do you
nonetheless thinking Virtue in the Cave: Moral Inquiry in Plato's Meno is not loveable to be your top
checklist reading book?

Jason Howell:

As a scholar exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or to
make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's heart and soul
or real their interest. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right
now there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and
can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you
personally. As we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise
word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Virtue in the Cave: Moral Inquiry in Plato's
Meno can make you really feel more interested to read.

Kelley Hardy:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information coming from a book. Book is written or printed or illustrated from each source in which filled
update of news. Within this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for you. From
media social including newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and
comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just in search of the Virtue in the Cave: Moral Inquiry in Plato's Meno when you required it?
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